This 1s a digitally signed Gazette, to verify click here.
http://rajpatrahimachal.nic.in

o194, feATae uaer

AT U9 U I g RT UhIiRid

dRAR, 16 RIawR, 2021 /25 9T5U<S, 1943

feuraa uo%r WReR
HIMACHAL PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
Shimla- 4, the 13th September, 2021

No. VS/Estt./6-62/81-I.—The Hon'ble Speaker, on the recommendations of the
Departmental Promotion Committee, is pleased to order the promotion Smt. Neelam Verma,

103—=TS9= / 2021—16—09—2021 (3459)



3464 ISTuA, feHEel EIé?T, 16 [ITHER, 2021 /25 HISUS, 1943

REAL ESTATE REGULATORY AUTHORITY HIMACHAL PRADESH
NOTIFICATION

Shimla, the 16th September, 2021

No. HP/RERA-(A)-3-2/Regulations/2020/Vol-1/1159.—In exercise of the powers
conferred by Section 85 of the Real Estate (Regulation and Development) Act, 2016 (Act No. 16
of 2016), read with the Himachal Pradesh Real Estate (Regulation and Development) Rules,
2017 and all other powers enabling it on that behalf, the Himachal Pradesh Real Estate Regulatory
Authority, hereby make following regulation to amend the Himachal Pradesh Real Estate
Regulatory Authority (Periodical Progress Reports), Regulation No. 4 of 2020 notified vide
Notification No. HP/RERA-(A)-3-2/ Regulations/ 2020/ Vol-1 dated 18-12-2020 and published
in the Official Gazette of Himachal Pradesh on 21-12-2020, namely.—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Regulation may be called the Himachal
Pradesh Real Estate Regulatory Authority (Periodical Progress Reports), Amendment Regulation,
No.2 of 2021.

(2) This Regulation shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official
Gazette of Himachal Pradesh.

2. Amendment in sub-regulation 3.—In clause (1) of sub-regulation (3) of the
Himachal Pradesh Real Estate Regulatory Authority (Periodical Progress Reports) Regulation



JoTq=, fBarEer uewr, 16 fydwx, 2021 /25 9reus, 1943 3465

No. 4 of 2020 (herenafter called as the said Regulation), for the words “fifteen days” the word
“one month” shall be substituted;

3. Amendment in sub-regulation 4.—In clause (1) of sub-regulation (4) of the said
Regulation, for the words “fifteen days” the word “one month” shall be substituted;

4. Amendment in sub-regulation 7.—In clause (1) of sub-regulation (7) of the
said Regulation, for the words “15™ of the subsequent” the word “one” shall be substituted.

By order,
Sd/-
(Dr. SHRIKANT BALDI),

Chairperson.



		2021-09-16T16:08:37+0530
	VIJAY KUMAR




